
TITUS COUNry
ROAD MATERIATS & ROAD OII.S, BID tr 2022-OO4

22-Aug-22

)uly 27 ,2022 and August 3, 2022

Deadline for ids Delivered to Countv Auditor's Office: August 15, 2022 at 4:30 PM

Date Bids Opened: 76-Aug-72

Bids Recei d, Oate Received. Ti e Received, Method of Deliverv
MATERIATS:

HE Spann & Co., lnc, August 75,2022,11:23 AM, Hand Delivered
RK Hall, LLC, August 1, 2022, t:O3 PM, Mailed
Seaton Construction, lnc, August !5,2022,10:04 AM, Hand Delivered
WM CCP Solutions, LLC, August 4, 2022, 11:49 MS, UpS

Richard Drake Construction Company, LP, August 12, 2022,11:49 AM, Federal Express
RK Hall, LLC, August 1, 2022,7:O3 PM, Hand Delivered

Contract Effective Dates

This bid is scheduled to be presented forapproval in Commissioners' Court on August 22,2022.
It is for a 1 year contract with option to renew for 2 additional year upon agreement by vendor
and county. Bid is initially effective september L, zo2z upon approval byARpA Grant Administrator,
Traylor & Associates.

FOB tO ION & ADDRESS FO R PICK UP

HE Spann, 1173 US HWY 57 E, Mt. Pleasant, Texas

Seaton Construction, Yard Pick-Up in Cookville, Texas & pitt pick-Up in Avinger, Texas
WM CCP Solutions, Welsh Generating Station, 7473 FM 1735, pittsburg, Texas
RK Hall, 244 OK L47, Sawye(, OK 74756 for ROAD MATERTALS

RK Hall, Mt. Pleasant Plant, 900 Cr 3010 S, Mt. pleasant, Texas for ROAD 01Ls
Richard Drake,221 CR 12530, Paris, Texas

NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT:

LOBBYING CERTIFICATION: Note A
CONFLICT OF INTEREST:

Note A: Lob

Seaton

YES

YES

YES

WM CCP

YE5

NO

NO

HE Spann

YES

YES

YES

RK Hall

YE5

YES

YES

R. Drake

YES

YES

YES

ng certification is req uired for bids or offers exceedine S 100,000.

GENERAL LIABIIITY IN SURANCE: YES YES NO NO YE5

Commissioners to determine the need for insurance when Titus County picks up a product.

Qro[ t{

Dates of Public Notice in Local Newspaper:

ROAD OttS:



TITUS COUNTY

ROAD MATERIALS BtD fl 2022-04 8l22l2oz2

ll*r.**{'*******HESPANN************:**ll RKHALL SEATON WM CCP

FTYASH

DIRECT

BASE PRICE

wo SURCHARGE TOTAL

SURCHARGE 7l2sl2122 7/2s12O22

SEAT COATAGGREGATE - TY B / GR 4 - PRICE PER TON:

DELIVERED S s1.11 52.6t at L4Y, 5 s3.72 S 64.38

PICKED UP No Bid S 4o.oo

I

FTEXBASE ASH - TYPE A - PRICE PER TON:

Flyash Rock Flex Ease

Delivered S 23.s0 5L.L2 Ar 74% 5 24.62 No Bid

No Bid S 1s.oo

FOB LOCATION Welsh Pla n

PlttsburB

Bottom Ash

Delivered I S 14.s0 5L.r2 at 14% No Bid

Picked Up No Bid S 5.oo

FOB LOCATION Welsh Plan

P ittsbu rg

FIEXIBtE BASE - PRICE PER TON:

2 inch Limestone Base, Per Ton:

Deliveret
Picked Up

5 25.86 52.15 at 14% S 28.01

S 31.s0
FOB LOCATION Mt Pleasant

3 inch Limestone Base, Per Ton:

S 26.61 52.rs at14% S 28.76

Picked Up S 31.s0
FOB LOCATION Mt Pleasa nt-'r.'-----_-----_|--

$rJ rt

ry!9q uP 
-

s 1s.62

Delivered

t-



ll**+*!*:!:*!1!HE SPANN'+ * l * ++1:** t * * * + ll
BASE PRICE

RK HALL SEATON WM CCP

wo SURCHARGE TOTAL

FLYASH

DIRECT

SURCHARGE 7l25lzo22 712512022

Other Size Limestone Base, Price Per Ton:

SIZE: 13/4" Limestone Base

Delivered , 5 27.67

S 31.s0
52.t5 at74% $ 29.76=a_--

Picked Up

FOB LOCATION Mt Pleasant

1 1/2" Sandstone Base, TXDOT Type A, Grade 2 or Equivalent, Price per Ton:

Delivered S 29.61 52.67atr4% 5 32.22 S 37.38

Picked Up S 32.s0 _,_ s 13.00 _
Sawyer, OKFOB LOCATION Mt PleasanL

Other Size Sandstone Base, TXDOT Type A, Grade 2 or Equivalent, Price per Ton:

SIZE: 1 3/4" Base
r-...1-----....-F._-

s2.61 s 33.22Delivered 5 30.61

Picked Up No bid

FTEXBASE, CRUSHED IRON ORE GRAVEL, PRICE PER CUBIC YARD:

PICKED UP AT THE PIT:

Delivered No Bid

Picked Up

FOB LOCATION Avinger

PICKED UP AT THE YARD:

Delivered No Bid

Picked Up s 28.00

FOB LOCATION Cookville

.1-

WASHED PEA GRAVEL, 3/8" TO #10, PRICE PER TON:

Delivered S 29.80 52.71 at L4%o S 31.91 S 42.38

Picked Up s 33.30

FOB LOCATION Mt Pleasant Sawyer, OK

Note 1

?: 
"N 

tt

s 18.00 .

s 18.00

Note 1: RK Hall: Ty "D", Sandstone 3/8"



HOTOILSAND: TYPE D ROCK 9%, FIETD SAND A5%, AC 1.5 OIL 6% - PRICE PER TON:

TITUS COUNTY DEADLINE: August 15, 2022 at 4:30 PM

BID SHEET - ROAD OIL BID S: 2022-004

RICHARD RK

DRAKE H ALL

FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS

Picked Up

Mt. Pleasa nt

Delivered s 102.80

- 5 qz.8o.
Paris, Tx

5 93.00

S 8s.oo

TYPE D COLD MIX (PER STATE OF TEXAS SPECS) . PRICE PER TON:

ryPE D HOT MIX: TYPE D ROCK 60%, SCREENINGS 15%, FIELD SAND 20%, AC 64-22 5%,

Mt. PleasantFOB LOCATION Paris, Tx

Picked Up

Delivered s 103.80

s 88.80
S 98.00

S 9o.oo

PRICE PER TON:

Dellvered S 113.90 S 98.00

Picked Up S 94.80 S 9o.oo

FOB LOCATION Paris, TX Mt. Pleasant

WPE D HOT MIX, LAID OOWN - PRICE PER TON:

Delivered & Laid Down S 162.90

Minimum Tons, if required 500 Tons

PLANT MIX SEAL, LAID DOWN, AC OIL PG 64.22 WITH OII- CONTENT 5.2%TO 6.4%

AND 1OO% TYPE D AGGREGATE - PRICE PER TON:

Delivered & Laid Down

Minimum Tons, if req uired

r
TYPE F COLD MIX, 1.50 OIT . PRICE PER TON:

Delivered 5 118.90

Picked Up S 103.90

FOB LOCATION Paris, TX

QqoC tt



No Bid

]HIGH PERFORMANCE - PRICE PER TON

s 145.00

S 12s.oo
Delivered

Picked Up

FoB LoCATION: RK Hall: Greenville Asphalt Plant, Tx 224, Greenville, Tx

S 106.80

s 91.80

ALTERNATE ITEM: STIFF OIL SAND OR COLD MIX

FOB TOCATION Paris, TX

De livered

Picked Up

FREIGHT: 23 Ton Minimum
s( ONE HALF) HOURAFTER:

S 12O.OO PER HOUR
ADDITIONAL NOTES FROM VENDOR:

DEMURRAGE:

pf# tt

i --1



THIS IS ADDENDUM #1, DATED 8-3.2022, FOR THE ROAD MATERIALS/ROAD OILS BID fr 2022-004,
DEADLINE AUGUST L5,2022 AT 4:30 pM.

Bids should reflect the cost ofthe materials with the fuel charge listed separatelv. The cost offuel will
be based on the us Energy lnformation Administration Gulf Coast (pADD3) 6asoline and Diesel Retail
Prices located at www.eia.gov/dnav. The initial fuel charge will be based on the value as of July 25,zoz2
which is the date closest to the initial advertising for these products. After July 2s, 2022, the fuel chargewill be adjusted up or down based on the information from this website. The prices are adlusted
weekly on Monday.

RECORDKEEPING FOR EQUAL EMPLOYMENTOPPORTUNITY

As this is not a "construction contract" as such, it wourd not be appricabre as far as maintaininB
records' Titus county is hopeful that the vendor would still comply with EEoc regulations. tn |".ponreto the wording on page 14, item (g), it recommended that the vendor send a cop-y of the generar
conditions and the EEOC Guidelines for Contractors to their sub_contractors.

FUEL SURCHARGE

LIQUIDATED DAMAGES

CONFLICT OF INTEREST

lf there is no conflict of interest, then the vendor should simply sign the form

END OF ADDENDUM

The statement on page 15 should now read: since the actual damages for any delay under this contract
are impossibre to determine, the contractor shall be liable for and shall pay to the county the sum ofone Hundred ($100'00) as fixed, agreed and riquidated damages for each deray of more than 3 work
days from the date the commissioner requested pick up or delivery and the bidder agreed to provide
said product if the product is not avairabre from a secondary approved vendor approved in conjunction
with this bid. These liquated damages are at the discretion of the commissioner.

$aa0t



Average Con P€rGallon of Fuel

RANGE

APPLICABLE

SURCHARGE

H.E. SPANN & CO., tNC

FUEL SURCHARGE

SPREAO

4.000

4.070

4.140

4_210

4_280

4_350

4.420

4.490

4.550

4.630

4.700

4.770

4.840

4.910

4.980

5.050

5.120

5.190

5.250

5.330

5.400

5.470

5.540

5.610

5.680

5.750

5.a20

5.a90

s.960

4.069

4.139

4.209

4.279

4.149

4.419

4.489

4.559

4.529

4.599

4.769

4.839

4.909

4.979

5.049

5.119

5.189

5.259

5.329

5.399

5.469

5.539

5.€O9

5.679

5.749

5.819

5.E49

5.959

6.029

0.059

0.069

0.059

0.069

0.059

0.059

0.069

0.069

0.059

0.059

0.059

0.059

0.069

0.069

0.069

0.069

0.069

0.059

0.059

0.069

0.069

0.(E9

0.069

0.069

0.069

0.059

0.069

0.059

0.069

t.o,v.

2.916

3.O%

4_@6

5-09(

5.('%

7.@4

8.0%

9.0%

10.0%

11.096

tz.ors

13.o%

74.66

15.0%

16.0%

17.O%

1,8.O%

19.0%

20.

21.@6

12.64

23.W
21.016

25.016

26.G6

27.V5

24.@$

29.O%

SURCHARGE ONLY APPLIES TO HAUL NOT MATERIAL

Note

'lhc lpplicable wcekly ,irel surcharge percentage shall bc dctemrined by rclerencing to lhe rcsults oflhc survcy
lor dicscl fuelpricing condlcM every Monday by thc Dcparm€nt of Encr$/-Enerry Informalion
Adnlinistralion. Dicsel prices reponed on Monday applied to lhc obove "scale' indicrtes
the surcharge lo be io cffect for that week.

EIA website is: https:/./t,/w.eia.gov/dnav/peupetjri_gnd_dcus_r30_w.hlrn
"CulfCoasl ReSion"

Ql# r'i



RICHARD DRAKE
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Haul Rate for Asphalt is $ 15.00 per ton with fuel at $4.00 pei gallon, our average is

approximately 50-mile hauls.

Haul rate will not be lower than $15.00 per ton and a fuel surcharged will be based on a

percentage conducted every Monday by the Deparhnent of Energy. Energy Information Center

Diesel Prices reported on Monday will be applied to the scale attached be1ow.

AltzleBe CDd Per 6'.llon ol FuEl

RAN6€

ATEdiJBIE
5UtCt386E

4.M)
lt 07c

4-14a1

3210

a.a9
44m
6,490

B-560

i-630

4-ico
L77A
.1.8tlr'

lSjs
4.,80
s.0!o
s.12D

5.1$
s2€o
5330
5.{OO

5A70
5.540

5.510

5.580

5.75!
5.820

9r90
5S60

*.059
4.I|9
4.2t8
4.Z7ll
4349
44!9
4.449

4559
4.629
+.59-r

4.769

4.839

+.94]E

4-979

5.e49

5-1:9
s.ue
5.259

5.S93

5.469
5519
5.609
5,579
s.749

5A19
5-889

5359
6.029

Lq'(
2-O%

r.0x
Lfi,
5.@
a.!16

7.ea

9,0?6

i.t.c%
12.O?.

,3.0!a

t4.cE
15.6"*

L6S$
i7.u4
i8.&t4
t9-6%

a&c$i
zt.a%
zLM
;3.0*
24.M
25-(ra

26-V,1

zttt4
?Ltu
E-tl

0.069

o.059

o.069

o.069

0.059

0.059

0.059

a.vs
0.069

0.069

0.069

0359

0.069

c38
ooEg

0.059

0.019

OIXB

0.059

0.t 6-0

0.069

0.069

o.(69
0,059

0,069

s.0€
0r)a
o.o5!l

0.059

J-

Q. l'u"l'"-
p So0tt{

6290 Hwy 271 N . P0WDERLY, TEXAS

www. richa rd d rakeco n s truc tio n. co m

75473 a 903.732.4781 FAX-903.732.4340

Addendum #1

Date 08103/22For the Road MaterialslRoad Oils Bid#2022-004


